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Manager's Introduction

As we write this newsletter, we have been reflecting on what a full and joy-packed
summer it’s been here at our home. Thank you to everyone - residents, relatives,
volunteers and our brilliant team, who helped make the past few months so special.
Grab a cuppa and enjoy a peek into our summer highlights!

If you know someone who would like to receive our email newsletters/updates just
let us know, or forward them the newsletter sign up link below:

Newsletter Sign-Up

Best wishes,

Tsitsi Shanyurai
Home Manager

Amberley Summer BBQ Celebration 

What a fantastic day we had at Amberley! Our recent BBQ brought together
residents, families, and friends for a day filled with sunshine, laughter, and plenty of
activities. The weather couldn’t have been more perfect – blue skies, warm
sunshine, and a gentle breeze made it the ideal setting for a summer gathering. We
were delighted to see so many relatives and guests joining in, making the day extra
special with their presence.

Residents were truly pampered, with nail painting and other relaxing treats on offer,
adding a touch of luxury to the day. Lively karaoke kept the atmosphere buzzing,
with both residents and visitors stepping up to the microphone to sing their hearts
out.

Children and adults alike enjoyed the activities, and of course, no BBQ would be
complete without delicious food fresh from the grill. The aroma of sizzling favourites
filled the air as everyone tucked in and enjoyed the feast.

It was heartwarming to see our community come together – families reconnecting,
friends sharing stories, and residents glowing with joy. The spirit of togetherness was
felt all around Amberley, and the smiles said it all.

A big thank you to everyone who helped organise the event, to our staff for their care
and effort, and to all the families and friends who joined us to make it a truly
memorable day.

Afternoon Tea Delight at Amberley

Residents at Amberley recently gathered for a delightful afternoon tea that brought
plenty of smiles and conversation. The room was filled with the comforting aroma of
freshly brewed tea and coffee, creating the perfect atmosphere for a relaxed and
enjoyable afternoon. 

A lovely spread of finger sandwiches, beautifully presented and full of flavour, was
served alongside an irresistible selection of cupcakes. With each bite and sip,
residents enjoyed not only the delicious treats but also the warmth of good company.
It was a truly special occasion that celebrated the simple pleasures of food,
friendship, and community.

Shaping the Future - Group Interview Session

We also took an important step in shaping the future of our care team by hosting a
group interview session for prospective Care Assistants. 

What made this recruitment day so special was the involvement of one of our lovely
residents, who took part in the process and brought a personal touch to the
interview. Her presence added a sense of warmth and offered genuine insight into
what daily life at Amberley feels like for those we support. With her natural charm
and thoughtful perspective, she helped ensure that the people we considered for the
role understood the values that matter most to us, including kindness, patience and
compassion.

Baby Shower Fun

We held a special baby shower as two members of our wonderful care team are
either welcoming or awaiting the arrival of their little ones. One colleague recently
gave birth to a beautiful baby, while another was preparing for her own bundle of joy
in the following weeks. The lounge was filled with colourful decorations, cheerful
music, thoughtful gifts and plenty of smiles as residents and staff came together to
celebrate.
 

Social Media

Make sure to check out the Amberley Care Home Facebook Page.
 

Don't Forget To 'Like' Us!
 

Leave A Review

We would be very grateful if you could spare a few minutes to write a review for us:
 

Carehome.co.uk Reviews

Google Reviews
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